
Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1087108
Vendor Name: NASBITE International

Check Details:
Check Number: 0342476
Check Amount: $ 650.00
Check Date: 9/11/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: INV_5017
Invoice Date: 4/16/2025
PO Number: P0019226
Voucher Number: V0899619

Document Type: AP Invoice
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Fri, Sep 5, 2025 at 01:20 PM UTC

"Ryan, Julie" <ryanj864@cod.edu>

FW: Transaction #4699659 - NASBITE International

"Ryan, Julie" <ryanj864@cod.edu>

CC: Kelly, Ileen <kellyi421@cod.edu>, Hernandez, Monica <hernandezm68@cod.edu>

BCC:

Hello Invoicing Team,

 

Could you please pay this invoice against PO019226.

 

Thank you,

Julie D Ryan

Executive Assistant to Joe Cassidy,

Associate VP, Workforce and Economic Development

Dean, Continuing Education and Public Services

630.942.3434

 

From: Fitzpatrick, Kellen <fitzpatrickk286@cod.edu> 
 Thursday, September 4, 2025 4:08 PMSent:

 Ryan, Julie <ryanj864@cod.edu>To:
 RE: Transaction #4699659 - NASBITE InternationalSubject:



 

Hi Julie,

 

Attached is a copy of the PO for NASBITE International. Please note, the invoice will need to be submitted directly 
to  so Accounts Payable can process payment.invoicing@cod.edu

 

Thank you, 
Kellen

 

From: Fitzpatrick, Kellen 
 Thursday, September 4, 2025 1:48 PMSent:

 Ryan, Julie < >To: ryanj864@cod.edu
 RE: Transaction #4699659 - NASBITE InternationalSubject:

 

Thank you for understanding! Have a great rest of your day 

 

Kellen

 

From: Ryan, Julie < > ryanj864@cod.edu
 Thursday, September 4, 2025 1:37 PMSent:

 Fitzpatrick, Kellen < >To: fitzpatrickk286@cod.edu
 RE: Transaction #4699659 - NASBITE InternationalSubject:

 

No worries. I fixed and resubmitted. I have only done a few of these so I’m not surprised I missed something.



 

Julie D Ryan

Executive Assistant to Joe Cassidy,

Associate VP, Workforce and Economic Development

Dean, Continuing Education and Public Services

630.942.3434

 

From: Fitzpatrick, Kellen < > fitzpatrickk286@cod.edu
 Thursday, September 4, 2025 1:31 PMSent:

 Ryan, Julie < >To: ryanj864@cod.edu
 RE: Transaction #4699659 - NASBITE InternationalSubject:

 

Hi Julie,

 

Unfortunately, I need to return this transaction to you to be submitted as an After the Fact request since this invoice 
is from April 16, 2025. Please resubmit with  as the Payment Request and  as After the Fact Confirming Request
the Release Method, as highlighted below.

 



 

Thank you!
Kellen

 

From: Ryan, Julie < > ryanj864@cod.edu
 Thursday, September 4, 2025 1:17 PMSent:

 Fitzpatrick, Kellen < >To: fitzpatrickk286@cod.edu
 Frick, Eric < >Cc: fricke@cod.edu

 RE: Transaction #4699659 - NASBITE InternationalSubject:

 

Hi Kellen,

 

Apologies, I missed a step. See attached.

 

Julie D Ryan



Executive Assistant to Joe Cassidy,

Associate VP, Workforce and Economic Development

Dean, Continuing Education and Public Services

630.942.3434

 

From: Fitzpatrick, Kellen < > fitzpatrickk286@cod.edu
 Thursday, September 4, 2025 1:07 PMSent:

 Ryan, Julie < >To: ryanj864@cod.edu
 Frick, Eric < >Cc: fricke@cod.edu

 Transaction #4699659 - NASBITE InternationalSubject:

 

Good afternoon,

 

Can you please send us confirmation of pricing (e.g. screenshot or quote) for this transaction? There are no notes or 
attachments with this request in ESM.

 



 

Thank you, 
Kellen
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